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INTRODUCTION  

The protracted crisis in Syria has caused a large influx of refugees into Jordan, amounting to more than 550,0001 as 
of September 2013. This figure is projected to increase to 800,000 by the end of December 2014. The arrival of extra 
refugees into an already resource-strained country, settling in often already economically struggling communities, has 
resulted in resources and services being over-stretched, increasing unemployment rates, and high inflation rates. To 
better understand the needs of the refugees and the host communities, with the support of the British Embassy 
Amman, REACH is undertaking assessments to inform the humanitarian response using an evidence-based 
approach to improve household and community level resilience and stabilisation.   
 

During September and October 2013, REACH carried out a key informant assessment in the five governorates of 
northern Jordan. This assessment is related to refugees from Syria in Jordanian host communities and is part of a 
wider, ongoing project to improve understanding of community vulnerabilities, resilience and coping mechanisms. An 
integral part of this project is the key informant assessment that focuses on two key elements: access to services by 
Syrian refugees relating to thematic sectors, and their prioritised needs by sector. The following phases of this project 
will identify and prioritise ‘hotspots’ for support to hosting communities, including a better understanding of capacities 
and stress-points of basic services for Jordanian and Syrian refugees.   

ASSESSMENT METHODOLOGY 

This key informant interview phase has had the overall objective of gaining an in depth understanding of sector 
specific and municipal service related issues in each Basic Service Unit (BSU), in order to inform more effective 
humanitarian planning and action to support the needs of the Syrian refugees. A BSU is a community or urban 
neighbourhood as defined by the key informants and an area which they have local knowledge of. This phase has 
followed a desk based literature review and macro level data collection in order to develop contextually relevant 
indicators for the key informant interviews. The information collected from key informants has been grouped and 
analysed in relation to access to services by refugees, challenges to access and ranking of needs.  
 
In total, 1041 key informants were interviewed representing 364 BSUs which were distributed throughout all 16 
districts (and sub districts) of the five northern Governorates of Jordan (Ajloun, Balqa. Irbid, Jarash and Mafraq). 
Depending on the number of households in the BSU, between one and seven key informants were interviewed in 
each BSU. Key informants were mainly of Syrian nationality but also included Jordanians who were knowledgeable 
about their community.  

DATA ANALYSIS AND DISTRICT PROFILES 

Key informant responses have been aggregated by BSU to give one response per question per BSU2. The 
information is aggregated to the level of a district, but is also available in a dataset at the BSU level.  The key 
informants responded with their perception across a range of indicators for the community as a whole. The data has 
also been analysed by thematic sector: shelter, food security, WASH, education, health and livelihoods. The district 
profiles contained herein are summaries of information focusing on the refugee context, with further research and 
assessments to be undertaken including refugees, vulnerable populations, communities, municipalities, and 
stakeholders in the host communities. Accompanying the district profiles is a research report with in-depth analysis, 
and a powerpoint presentation summarising the key findings. 
 

For more information, please contact reach.mena@impact-initiatives.org  

                                                           
1 UNHCR 2013 population data http://data.unhcr.org/syrianrefugees/regional.php 

2
 The information contained in these district profiles reflect the perceptions of the key informants speaking on behalf of their 

communities and not just their own households. In some instances, further analysis will be required to get a much better 

understanding of the reason for the responses.  
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